
OCA/CPA- 316 BID TABULATION BID OPENING:10/06/05
PC PERIPHERAL MAINTENANCE                                                                                                                                     11:00 AM

VENDOR Region I Region II Region III Region IV

Electronic Interface Associates

Inc.

$998,556.78 No bid No bid No bid

Volt Delta Resources LLC- 

Maintech division

$445,935.00 $93,468.00 $77,180.00 $50,444.00

Diebold Information and Security

Systems

$651,264.00 $163,740.00 $105,996.00 $86,676.00

Vitech Solutions $424,089.00 $92,262.00 $58,155.00 $62,571.00

Integrated Strategies and Support

Inc.

$898,767.00 $189,235.00 No bid No bid

NPA Computers Inc. $275,127.00 $60,864.00 $60,783.24 $46,965.72

Percon. Computer Corp $2,779,510 No bid No bid No bid

New England Systems Inc. $733,910.00 $204,607.40 $131,483.90 $102,584.00

DLI, LLC $460,459.00 $88,505.00 $61,386.00 $46,890.00

Integrated Support Strategies $616,904.00 No bid No bid No bid

Comservco USA  Inc. $512,335.00 No bid No bid No bid

NO BID
Decision One
NO RESPONSE
Computer Services Group  Barrister Information Systems Infokeen Computers
Technical Business Solutions Millennium Information Group Net Tech Computer Specialists Inc.
Syline Connections Epoch                                                              Derive Technologies 
TriTech Communications Inc. 
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